

February 22, 2022

Gunstock Mountain Resort
719 Cherry Valley Road
Gilford, NH 03249

Invoice No.: 604765
Client No.: 015471
Matter No.: 102471

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services rendered through February 15, 2022:

RE: General

Professional Services	\$ 4,025.50
Total Disbursements	<u>\$ 195.05</u>
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 4,220.55

Retainer Available for Ongoing Professional Fees and Costs	\$ 19,751.28
Retainer Money Held Until the End of the Matter	\$.00

Invoice No. 604765

February 22, 2022

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date		Description of Service	Hours	Amount
1/24/22	TQ	Review of long letter from Sen. Guide to Rep. Sylvia; long teleconference with Gary K. regarding same and Rep Sylvia's failure to set a meeting date as he agreed to do earlier	.80	240.00
1/28/22	TQ	Conference with LVM to review case developments since we were both in trial and information for client; review of her review of bylaws for how GAC conducts meetings if there is a new Commissioner; review of email regarding recording of Preliminary Trial hearing; teleconference with Gary K. regarding upcoming NH legislature bill re: Gunstock finances and Delegation hearing	1.30	390.00
1/28/22	LM	Conference with Attorney Quarles regarding updates on matter and next steps including upcoming 1/31 Delegation meeting and preparation for 2/16 Motion to Dismiss hearing	.40	86.00
1/28/22	LM	Review and analyze GAC By-laws regarding election of officers and procedural requirements for added agenda items and communicate with Attorney Quarles regarding same, and send email to Gary Kiedaisch and Rebecca LaPense with recording of 12/23 Superior Court Hearing	1.10	236.50
1/31/22	TQ	Review of Court's Order denying our Motion for Reconsideration of Court's injunction ruling; email to Gary K. regarding same and tonight's Delegation hearing; review of Delegation's Motion to Stay litigation and notes on same; email to Gary K. regarding same	.80	240.00
1/31/22	LM	Review and analyze Notice of Decision denying GAC's Motion to Reconsider Order denying Preliminary Injunction	.10	21.50
1/31/22	LM	Review and analyze Defendant's Motion to Stay	.20	43.00
2/01/22	TQ	Email to Gary K. regarding yesterday's hearings; review of his response; reply to him	.30	90.00
2/07/22	TQ	Email from Gary K. and responding to him	.10	30.00
2/08/22	TQ	Emails and voicemail from Gary K.; conference with LVM to review Delegation's Motion to Stay and what position GAC should take on it; long teleconference with Gary K. to review above and general timeline for upcoming Court events, GAC and Delegation meetings and position to take with opposing counsel as to our conditional agreement to Motion to Stay; emails from opposing counsel regarding above; conference with LVM regarding same and her eventual agreement from them to continue upcoming Motion to Dismiss hearing and our limited Objection to their Motion to Stay	2.00	600.00
2/08/22	LM	Conference with Attorney Quarles regarding analysis of Delegation's Motion to Stay and strategy for response to same, and potential continuance of upcoming Motion to Dismiss hearing	.50	107.50
2/08/22	LM	Phone call with Gary Kiedaisch and Attorney Quarles regarding Delegation's Motion to Stay and upcoming Motion to Dismiss hearing, status of Delegation's removal efforts, and strategy going forward	.40	86.00

Invoice No. 604765

February 22, 2022

Date		Description of Service	Hours	Amount
2/08/22	LM	Phone call with Delegation's counsel Attorney Morgan Tanafon regarding potential stipulation as to stay in exchange for agreement of no removal in the interim and continuance of 2/16 Motion to Dismiss hearing	.20	43.00
2/08/22	LM	Review email from Attorney Tanafon regarding Delegation's response to GAC's proposal regarding the Delegation's Motion to Stay and Continue the Motion to Dismiss hearing	.10	21.50
2/08/22	LM	Phone call to Attorney Tanafon regarding assent to continuance of 2/16 Motion to Dismiss hearing and communicate with Attorney Quarles regarding same; draft Assented-to Motion to Continue same	1.30	279.50
2/09/22	TQ	Email from LVM; review, analysis and editing of her Motion to Continue MTD hearing; email to Attorney Tanafon to review Motion before filing; review of his response approving same; conference with LVM regarding outline for our Limited Objection to Delegation's Motion to Stay	.70	210.00
2/09/22	LM	Review email correspondence between Attorney Quarles and Attorney Tanafon regarding draft Motion to Continue 2/16 Motion to Dismiss hearing and finalize Motion for filing; e-file same with Belknap Superior Court	.40	86.00
2/09/22	LM	Work on drafting GAC's Limited Objection to Belknap County Delegation's Motion to Stay	1.10	236.50
2/09/22	LM	Continue drafting and revising GAC's Limited Objection to Defendant's Motion to Stay	.80	172.00
2/10/22	TQ	Review, analysis, editing and revising of our Limited Objection to Delegation's Motion to Stay; teleconference with LVM to review same; review of Delegation's Notice of Intent to Reply; email regarding same and teleconference with LVM	.70	210.00
2/10/22	LM	Revise and finalize GAC's Limited Objection to Defendant's Motion to Stay and send to Attorney Quarles for review	.50	107.50
2/10/22	LM	Conference with Attorney Quarles regarding GAC's Limited Objection to Defendant's Motion to Stay	.10	21.50
2/10/22	LM	Review Notice of Intent to Reply filed by Belknap County Delegation in support of its Motion to Stay	.10	21.50
2/11/22	LM	Review Notice of Decision continuing 2/16 Motion to Dismiss hearing and email client regarding same	.20	43.00
2/14/22	TQ	Review of Court's Order granting Motion to Continue Motion to Dismiss Hearing; review of email to Gary K. regarding same; email and teleconference with LVM regarding status and planning	.40	120.00
2/15/22	TQ	Review of multiple emails from Gary K. and responses from LVM; review of GAC Bylaws regarding same; teleconference with him regarding same and general status review and Dr. Strang's sign on to Sylvia's Declaration of Independence; review of Delegation's Reply to our Limited Objection to their Motion to Stay; conference with LVM regarding above	.80	240.00
2/15/22	LM	Review and respond to emails from Gary Kiedaisch regarding analysis of GAC bylaws	.10	21.50
2/15/22	LM	Review and analyze Belknap County Delegation's Reply to GAC's limited objection to BCD's Motion to Stay	.10	21.50

Invoice No. 604765

February 22, 2022

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES \$ 4,025.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description	Qty	Rate	Amount
	Courier Services			74.28
1/31/22	Telephone and Data charges			120.77
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS				\$ 195.05

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Hours	Rate	Total
Thomas Quarles	7.90	300.00	2,370.00
Lynnette Macomber	7.70	215.00	1,655.50
TOTALS	15.60		\$ 4,025.50

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 4,220.55



ATTORNEYS AT LAW

February 22, 2022

Gunstock Mountain Resort
719 Cherry Valley Road
Gilford, NH 03249

Invoice No.: 604765
Client No.: 015471
Matter No.: 102471

REMITTANCE ADVICE

RE: General

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE

\$ 4,220.55

Please return this advice with payment to:

Devine Millimet & Branch, P.A.
Attn: Accounts Receivable
P.O. Box 719
Manchester, NH 03105
(603) 669-1000

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT

Tax Identification No. 02-0336151

For Billing Inquiries please contact Accounts Receivable at AR@devinemillimet.com

Your prompt payment is greatly appreciated.

DEVINE, MILLIMET
& BRANCH
PROFESSIONAL
ASSOCIATION

111 AMHERST STREET
MANCHESTER
NEW HAMPSHIRE
03101

T 603.669.1000
F 603.669.8547
DEVINEMILLIMET.COM

MANCHESTER, NH
CONCORD, NH
PORTSMOUTH, NH